Asphalt Emulsion

Asphalt Emulsion Iltem List

03/10/2021

10:00 AM

Description Units Point Of Supply Price At Pos Price
Delivered
CRS-2 Gallon |No Bld 0 0
CRS-2M Gallon |Bay City $1.50 $1.59
MS-OP Gallon |[Bay City $2.64 $2.75
SS-1H Tack Gallon [See Alternative 0 0
CSS-1H (dilute) (Fog seal) Gallon [No Bid 0 0
CQSEA (quick set) Fog seal) Gallon |See Alternative 0 0
AE-90 Gallon |Bay Clty $1.69 $1.75
AMS Seal SP Gallon |No Bid 0 0
Asphalt Emulsion Item List - suggested substitutions or options
Alternate '
Description Units Point Of Supply Price At Pos Price
Delivered
LTBC-2 Gallons Bay City $2.00 $2.09
Cationic Chiplock Gallons Bay City $1.19 $1.28
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Price At Pos

Description Units Price
Delivered
CRS-2 Gallon [No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRS-2M Gallon [Alma, Ml $1.54 $1.63
MS-OP Gallon [No Bid No Bid No Bid
SS-1H Tack Gallon [Alma, Ml $1.84 $1.99
CSS-1H (dilute) (Fog seal) Gallon [Alma, Ml $1.26 $1.41
CQSEA (quick set) Fog seal) Gallon [Alma, M $1.26 $1.41
AE-90 Gallon [No Bid No Bid No Bid
AMS Seal SP Gallon |Alma, MI $1.85 $2.00




