Item

Item List

3/4" x 8" x 6' Curved-Single Bevel-Heat Treated - each 800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 8" x 7' Curved-Single Bevel-Heat Treated - each 300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 8" x 6' Single Bevel-Through Hardened - each 800.00 No Bid $114.18 $116.40
3/4" x 8" x 7' Curved-Single Bevel-Through Hardened - each 300.00 No Bid $131.91 $135.00
Scarifier bit w/ square washer comparable to SANDVIK MT10106 - each | 500.00 $6.10 No Bid No Bid
9' Patrol Wing Carbide Blade 6"x108" - each 20.00 No Bid No Bid $900.00
7/8" x 5"x 48" Single Tungsten Carbide Insert Grader Blades - each 50.00 No Bid No Bid $233.80
3/4"x6"x48" Single Tungsten Carbide Insert Blades - each 50.00 No Bid No Bid $247.00
Optional Blade - each 1.00

Optional Blade - each 1.00




