

Bituminous Products February 10, 2023 - 10:00 AM

Bit-Mat Products of Michigan, Inc.

Description	Units	Point Of Supply	Price At Pos	Price Delivered
CRS-2M	Gallon	401 Tiernan Rd, Bay City	\$ 2.03	\$ 2.15
MS-OP	Gallon	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -
SS-1H Tack	Gallon	See Alternate LTBC-2	\$ -	\$ -
CSS-1H (dilute) (Fog seal)	Gallon	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -
CQSEA (quick set) Fog seal)	Gallon	See Alternate Cationic Chiplock	\$ -	\$ -
AE-90	Gallon	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -
AMS Seal SP	Gallon	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -
Penetrating Emulsion Prime	Gallon	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -

Asphalt Emulsion Item List - suggested substitutions or options

OPTIONAL

Description	Units	Point Of Supply	Price At Pos	Price Delivered
LTBC-2	Gallon	401 Tiernan Rd, Bay City	\$ 2.38	\$ 2.50
Cationic Chiplock	Gallon	401 Tiernan Rd, Bay City	\$ 1.63	\$ 1.75

Michigan Paving & Materials Co.

Description	Units	Point Of Supply	Price At Pos	Price Delivered
CRS-2M	Gallon	1950 Williams St., Alma	\$ 2.06	\$ 2.18
MS-OP	Gallon	NA	\$ -	\$ -
SS-1H Tack	Gallon	1950 Williams St., Alma	\$ 2.75	\$ 2.87
CSS-1H (dilute) (Fog seal)	Gallon	NA	\$ -	\$ -
CQSEA (quick set) Fog seal)	Gallon	1950 Williams St., Alma	\$ 1.38	\$ 1.50
AE-90	Gallon	NA	\$ -	\$ -
AMS Seal SP	Gallon	1950 Williams St., Alma	\$ 2.18	\$ 2.30
Penetrating Emulsion Prime	Gallon	1950 Williams St., Alma	\$ -	\$ -

Bit Mat:

Demurrage - 3 hours free, \$125/hour after
9000 gallon minimum load

Return freight - 1-1/2 outbound rate - \$200 minimum

Michigan Paving:

Minimum Load 9,000 gallons.

1. Load Size and Freight Rate Adjustments

a. Unless noted otherwise; freight rate quoted represents this minimum load size stated for the product up to maximum amount allowed on the delivery vehicle.

b. Orders less than the minimum quantity per 1a are subject to a rate per gallon adjustment to be determined at the time of ordering.

2. Demurrage rate and schedule:

a. Rate: \$100.00/hour after unload schedule

b. Schedule: i. 2 hours after the first occurrence of either unloading or delivery time.

3. Multiple Delivery Locations

a. \$200.00 for each additional location

4. Cancellations

a. Rate: \$350.00 if less than schedule

b. Schedule:

i. 6 hours prior to load time for first load each day and
ii. 90 minutes prior to load time for all subsequent loads each day.